
[TO BE PUBLISHED IN THE GAZETTE OF INDIA, EXTRAORDINARY, PART II,  

SECTION 3, SUB-SECTION (i)]  

 

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA 

MINISTRY OF FINANCE 

(DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE) 

Notification No. 81/2017–Customs 

  

New Delhi, the 27th October, 2017 

 

G.S.R.   (E).-  In  exercise  of  the  powers  conferred  by  sub-section  (1)  of  section  25  of  

the Customs  Act,  1962  (52  of  1962),  the Central Government, hereby makes the 

following further amendments in the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry 

of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.14/2006-Customs,  dated  the 1st  March,  2006,  

published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary vide number G.S.R. 86 (E), dated the 1st 

March, 2006, namely:- 

In the said notification, in the Table,- 

(i) against S. Nos. 41, 42, 43 and 44, in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures 

“20%” shall be substituted; 

 

(ii) against S. Nos. 45, and 46,- 

  

(a) in column (2), for the figures “5407 44 00”, the figures, brackets and words 

“5407 44 (except tariff item 5407 44 20)”shall be substituted; 

 

(b) in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 

 

 

(iii) against S. Nos. 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56 and 57, in column (4), for the 

figures “10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 

 

(iv) against S. Nos. 58 and 59,- 

 

(a) in column (2), for the figures “5407 82”, the figures, brackets and words 

“5407 82 (except tariff item 5407 82 50)”shall be substituted; 

(b) in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 

 

(v) against S. Nos. 60 and 61, in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures “20%” 

shall be substituted; 

 

(vi) against S. Nos. 62 and 63,- 

 

(a) in column (2), for the figures “5407 84”, the figures, brackets and words 

“5407 84 (except tariff item 5407 84 50)”shall be substituted; 

(b) in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 

 

(vii) against S. Nos. 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72 and 73, in column (4), for the 

figures “10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 



 

(viii) against S. Nos. 74 and 75,- 

 

(a) in column (2), for the figures “5408 24”, the figures, brackets and words 

“5408 24 (except tariff items 5408 24 12, 5408 24 13, 5408 24 15, 5408 24 

18)”shall be substituted; 

(b) in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 

 

(ix) against S. Nos. 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 

94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102 and 103, in column (4), for the figures  

“10%”, the figures “20%” shall be substituted; 

 

(x) against S. No. 104,in column (2), for the figures “5801 10”, the figures “5801 10 

00”shall be substituted; 

 

 

(xi) against S. No. 108,in column (2), for the figures “5801 25 00”, the figures, 

brackets and words “5801 27 20”shall be substituted; 

 

(xii) against S. Nos. 111 and 112, in column (4), for the figures “10%”, the figures 

“20%” shall be substituted. 

                           

                                                                                                           [F.No.354/123/2017-TRU] 

 

 

 

 

(Mohit Tewari) 

Under Secretary to the Government of India 

 

Note:- The principal notification No.14/2006-Customs, dated the 1st March, 2006 was 

published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide number G.S.R. 86 (E), dated the 1st 

March, 2006 and was last amended vide notification No.35/2007-Customs, dated the 1st 

March, 2007 and published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, vide number G.S.R 168 

(E), dated the 1st March, 2007. 


